
Universal Rights Systemic Violations and
Cultural Relativism in Morocco: A Critical
Examination
The concept of universal human rights has been a subject of intense
debate and discussion for centuries. While some argue that certain
fundamental rights and freedoms are inherent to all human beings,
regardless of their cultural or social background, others contend that
cultural relativism should be taken into account when assessing human
rights violations. Morocco, with its rich cultural heritage and complex
history, provides a particularly relevant case study for examining the
tension between universal rights and cultural relativism. This article aims to
shed light on the systemic violations of universal rights in Morocco and
critically examine the arguments in favor of cultural relativism as a
justification for these violations.
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Morocco has a long history of human rights abuses, including violations of
freedom of expression, assembly, and association, as well as arbitrary
detention, torture, and other forms of ill-treatment. These violations are
documented by numerous human rights organizations, including Amnesty
International, Human Rights Watch, and the United Nations.

Freedom of expression is severely restricted in Morocco. The government
maintains tight control over the media, and journalists who criticize the
monarchy or the government face harassment, intimidation, and
imprisonment. In 2017, the Moroccan journalist Hajar Raissouni was
sentenced to one year in prison for having an abortion and engaging in
extramarital sex. The charges against Raissouni were widely seen as
politically motivated, and her case drew international condemnation.

The right to assembly is also severely restricted in Morocco. Protests and
demonstrations are often met with excessive force by security forces. In
2011, the Moroccan government violently suppressed a pro-democracy
movement known as the 20th February Movement. Hundreds of protesters
were arrested, and many were tortured and ill-treated.

Arbitrary detention is a common practice in Morocco. Security forces often
arrest people without warrants and hold them for extended periods of time
without charge. In 2016, the Moroccan government adopted a new anti-
terrorism law that gives security forces broad powers to arrest and detain
suspects without due process. This law has been used to target political
dissidents and human rights activists.

Torture and other forms of ill-treatment are also widespread in Morocco.
Security forces often use torture to extract confessions from suspects. In



2013, the Moroccan government adopted a new law that criminalizes
torture, but the law has not been effectively implemented. Torture remains a
common practice in Morocco, and perpetrators are rarely held accountable.

Cultural Relativism as a Justification for Human Rights Violations

Some argue that cultural relativism should be taken into account when
assessing human rights violations. Cultural relativism is the view that道德标
准are relative to the culture in which they are found. According to this view,
there is no such thing as universal human rights, and what is considered a
human rights violation in one culture may not be considered a violation in
another.

Cultural relativism has been used to justify human rights violations in
Morocco. For example, some have argued that the Moroccan government's
restrictions on freedom of expression are justified because they are in
accordance with Moroccan cultural values. Similarly, some have argued
that the government's use of torture is justified because it is a traditional
practice in Morocco.

There are several problems with the argument that cultural relativism can
justify human rights violations. First, cultural relativism can be used to
justify any kind of human rights violation. If there are no universal human
rights, then anything goes. This could lead to a complete breakdown of the
international human rights system.

Second, cultural relativism ignores the fact that human rights are universal.
All human beings, regardless of their culture, are entitled to the same basic
rights and freedoms. These rights are essential for human dignity and well-
being.



Third, cultural relativism can be used to perpetuate oppression. In many
cultures, women and minorities are subjected to discrimination and
violence. If cultural relativism is accepted, then these abuses can be
justified as simply being part of the culture. This would have disastrous
consequences for human rights.

The systemic violations of universal rights in Morocco are a serious
concern. While cultural relativism may be a valid concept in some contexts,
it cannot be used to justify human rights violations. All human beings are
entitled to the same basic rights and freedoms, regardless of their culture.
The international community must continue to pressure Morocco to improve
its human rights record and to respect the universal rights of all its citizens.
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