
The American Way of War Finance and the
Decline of Democracy
The American Way of War Finance has led to the decline of democracy.
The US has been engaged in a state of perpetual war since the end of
World War II, and this has resulted in a massive increase in military
spending. This spending has been financed through borrowing, which has
led to a national debt of over $20 trillion. The debt has put a strain on the
economy and has made it difficult for the government to address other
important issues, such as education, healthcare, and infrastructure.
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The decline of democracy has been caused by the increasing power of the
military-industrial complex. This complex has a vested interest in
maintaining a state of war, and it has used its influence to promote policies
that have led to the decline of democracy. These policies include the

FREE

https://biography.deedeebook.com/reads.html?pdf-file=eyJjdCI6ImZZOWlLY3QxcnNKNjBYOWJ4elhsOVwvVWJScGtCOEpGU2tnR29tdVhocllkMHNjTElGd21TV0drZ0RDaENlWHY3c3RRUWJRT0xcL29CZkxFdThyZ0JyOXlnXC9hRjROZXluXC9NK0pNZ0twa3BmMXNhNzQ0NXlJcXZIQ3U5clUxNWZoQjBBWmNCYXdzWWZZT1JHTk1zZk1JYkNaOFliSDZ4dW9nUHNxR1ZwRXU0eEEwMmI5SkFGOU5MVWdBRUVHU1BKV0w4R3hKclZXVUlaa0k4aXFUNW1zcXhRPT0iLCJpdiI6ImIyN2MwNmJlNGI5OTU5YjgzNGJmYTI3NDIzMzM0Zjk0IiwicyI6IjRjNDMxNTM0YTdmOTczMjMifQ%3D%3D
https://biography.deedeebook.com/reads.html?pdf-file=eyJjdCI6ImlEUVNEY0ZJT0U0REtSemp2Tmd5WXEweGRLWXZJSXQ5Y2pReGhsNjhSYkxadzV3MGZ0WEhLbTR4Vm1QRWFtYlM3c0ZoN3VHZlJNbllsTEN2d25LZXB2TTJMNlpqakhGYjZXU3B4UlIyN2M0bjNPOTc0cU1HN2Q0VVNVV0pWMG9rWjFRUEk0K0NQWHlCVWlRQ1VnanFXOEErdkx2N284MlRTdGJzQ0ZmKytmdTZcL3FYZFJKdUh4SnBmS0RVQnB1MXZMVkI4VnpxdG1kdDhpRDdIN3lGU2RnPT0iLCJpdiI6ImVkNWFmOTMyYzU4NjBmNWZiMGQ5ZmFmZGUzMjBmYTQzIiwicyI6ImZkYzEzZDZiYjg4NzEzZGYifQ%3D%3D
https://biography.deedeebook.com/reads.html?pdf-file=eyJjdCI6IjZPXC9GOFUyS21XUHRGNFhnMkZcL3FLdUV1eDUyYk9lazhXcGlIU2dOeWUxcXRsdGlaVXYyTWZTMXBsbXF1NXBEVnZ5STJkS2FJa1FLVFU1RldPa2ZZM1AwdG5Da0kyN3FYME9JRnBVR0Z0RmUyUnpaM0ZpRUoyYWF3bmVcL2VRbHVNVXluXC9JcGQ2MVI2Skdkcm9qb0N4QXlBTDRBYWNnTmxBWnE3YUhwWFI3QzVIRCtnS0FjQjZUNU1zbHhEQXBZRUtmWEYyQTZTeUtMbWpoQmRrNnVzQjhRPT0iLCJpdiI6ImY1NWIwMjU2MmExMWIyOGNmYWZiZmVkNWI3N2RmNWE1IiwicyI6IjdlZjJhNzg5OGFmM2Q4NjMifQ%3D%3D


erosion of civil liberties, the suppression of dissent, and the use of
propaganda to deceive the public.

The Erosion of Civil Liberties

The military-industrial complex has eroded civil liberties in the name of
national security. The Patriot Act, for example, has given the government
sweeping powers to spy on its citizens without a warrant. The National
Defense Authorization Act has authorized the military to detain US citizens
indefinitely without charge or trial. These laws have undermined the Fourth
Amendment and the Fifth Amendment, which protect citizens from
unreasonable searches and seizures and from being held without due
process of law.

The Suppression of Dissent

The military-industrial complex has also suppressed dissent. The
government has used its power to intimidate and harass activists who
oppose war. The FBI has infiltrated and disrupted anti-war groups. The CIA
has conducted covert operations to destabilize foreign governments that
are opposed to US policy. These actions have made it difficult for citizens to
express their views and to hold their government accountable.

The Use of Propaganda

The military-industrial complex has used propaganda to deceive the public
about the costs and benefits of war. The government has used the media to
promote a positive image of the military and to downplay the human cost of
war. It has also used propaganda to justify wars that are not in the best
interests of the United States. These actions have misled the public and



have made it difficult for citizens to make informed decisions about war and
peace.

The Threat to Democracy

The American Way of War Finance is a threat to democracy. It has led to a
massive increase in military spending, which has put a strain on the
economy and has made it difficult for the government to address other
important issues. It has also led to the decline of democracy by increasing
the power of the military-industrial complex. This complex has eroded civil
liberties, suppressed dissent, and used propaganda to deceive the public.
These actions have undermined the foundations of democracy and have
made it difficult for citizens to hold their government accountable.

The American Way of War Finance is not sustainable. The US cannot
continue to borrow money to finance its wars. The national debt is already
too high, and it is only going to get worse. The US needs to find a new way
to finance its wars, or it will face a financial crisis. The US also needs to find
a new way to address the threats to democracy. The military-industrial
complex is too powerful, and it is undermining the foundations of
democracy. The US needs to find a way to reduce the power of the
complex and to restore the balance between the military and the civilian
sectors.
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